
"I searched for a man among them who would build up the wall and stand in 
the gap before Me for the land, so that I would not destroy it; but I found no one."

- Ezekiel 22:30 NASB

18 MONTHS AGO TODAY TOMORROW (2019-2020)

Ministry to U.S. Pastors ▶ Restore a High View of God and Scripture in the Church

• Occasional conference
speaker

• Encourage with broadcasts
and small group resources

• Mentor area pastors

• Developed The Real God
Churchwide Discipleship
Campaign

• Partnership with RightNow
Media to engage 16,000
churches

• Leave Senior Pastor role to
devote 100% energy to  Living
on the Edge

• Develop Why I Believe
Discipleship Campaign aimed
at younger Christians

• Partner with David C. Cook
Publishing to engage 45,000
churches

• Develop ministry to pastors
with a focus on personal life,
preaching, and leadership
development

Ministry to Chinese Pastors ▶ Resource 2 Million Leaders by December 2020

• Nonexistent • 3 trips to China
• Distributed 700,000 copies of

The Real God with training in 9
cities

• Translation of True Spirituality
Romans 12 book completed

• Complete the distribution of 1
million copies of The Real God 
book with training

• Launch printing and
distribution of 1 million copies
of True Spirituality

• Equip national pastors to train
others as restrictions increase

Ministry to Middle East Pastors ▶ Introduce Transformational Discipleship Small Groups

• Broadcast 9 times each week
on television through Arab
speaking world

• The Invisible War spiritual
warfare book in Arabic

• Leadership conference in
Malta reaching 23 Arab
countries

• True Spirituality Romans 12
book and small group
resource in Arabic

• Taught 1,600 pastors in Cairo
and provided True Spirituality
book in Arabic

• Provide training in forming
Biblical community to 1,600
Protestant churches in Egypt

• Partner with RZIM to launch
small group discipleship

• The Real God book and small
group in Arabic

Ministry to Next Gen ▶ Recapture Future Generations to Biblical Faith

• Spoke at 2 conferences
• Wrote Why I Believe book

• Filmed apologetics content for
Christians losing their way

• Hired staff to develop digital
resources and distribution

• Mentored select Next Gen
pastors and leaders

• Mentor Next Gen pastors
• Speak at Next Gen conferences
• Create online courses and

technology to reach Next Gen
audience




